
2015 IBC® Transition from
the 2009 IBC®

Based on the International Building Code® (IBC®)

2015



 

 
2015 IBC Transition from the 2009 IBC 

 

 

 

 

 

First Printing: March 2015 

 

 

COPYRIGHT © 2015 
by 

International Code Council, Inc. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ALL RIGHTS RESERVED. The 2015 IBC Transition from the 2009 IBC is a copyrighted work owned by the 
International Code Council, Inc. Without advance written permission from the copyright owner, no part of this book 
may be reproduced, distributed, or transmitted in any form or by any means, including, without limitation, 
electronic, optical or mechanical means (by way of example and not limitation, photocopying, or recording by or in 
an information storage retrieval system). For information on permission to copy material exceeding fair use, please 
contact: ICC Publications, 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478. Phone 1-888-ICC-SAFE 
(422-7233).  
 
Trademarks: “International Code Council,” the “International Code Council” logo, the “IBC” and the “International 
Building Code” are trademarks of the International Code Council, Inc. 
 
 
 

PRINTED IN THE U.S.A. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 1 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 1 Administration (Chapters 1 and 2)
Change of use or 
occupancy 

  111.1  
A change in a building’s use, or portion of a 
building’s use, with no change in its occupancy 
classification now requires that a new certification 
of occupancy be issued by the building code 
official. 

Definitions  202 
For consistency and usability purposes, all 
definitions of terms specifically defined in the IBC 
have now been moved to a single location in 
Chapter 2 

 

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6)
Assembly rooms 
associated with Group E 
occupancies 

303.1.3 
The allowance for a Group E classification of 
accessory assembly spaces in school buildings has 
been clarified so as to not confuse the provision 
with the mixed‐occupancies requirements dealing 
with accessory occupancies as regulated by Section 
508.2. 

 

Occupancy classification 
of food processing 
facilities and commercial 
kitchens 

303.3, 306.2 
The appropriate occupancy classification of a 
commercial kitchen has been clarified based 
upon the kitchen’s relationship, or lack of a 
relationship, to dining facilities. 

 

  304.1 
Small (2,500 sq. ft. or less in area) food processing 
establishments and commercial kitchens not 
associated with dining facilities are now considered 
as Group B occupancy. 
 
306.2 
A classification of Group F‐1 is now applied only to 
larger‐sized (over 2,500 sq. ft. in area) food 
processing facilities and commercial kitchens not 
associated with dining facilities. 

Training and skill 
development facilities 

  304.1 
The Group B classification for training and skill 
development uses has been clarified to address the 
ages of the occupants using the facility, the 
occupant load limitation where the facility is used 
for assembly purposes, and the types of permitted 
uses. 

Facilities generating 
combustible dusts 

Table 307.1(1), Section 307.4 
In the determination of occupancy classification for a 
facility where combustible dusts are anticipated, a 
technical report and opinion must now be provided to 
the building official that provides all necessary 
information for a qualified decision as to the potential 
combustible dusts hazards. 

 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 2 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued
Definition of care facilities  308.2, 202 

A number of new definitions related to care 
facilities have been added and some existing 
definitions have been revised to provide clarity and 
consistency in application. 

 

Group I‐1 occupancy 
classification 

  308.3 
The uses permitted in Group I‐1 custodial care 
facility have been expanded to include care 
recipients who may need a limited degree of verbal 
or physical assistance if responding to a fire or other 
emergency situation. 

Occupancy classification for 
medical care facilities. 
Group I‐2 occupancy 
classification 

  308.4 
Two basic conditions of Group I‐2 medical care uses 
that have previously been regulated together as a 
single category have been created, dividing the 
classification into short‐term care facilitates, such 
as, hospitals, and long‐term care facilities, such as 
nursing homes. 

Group R‐3 lodging house    310.5 
Lodging houses are now specifically defined in 
Chapter 2 and are typically permitted to be 
constructed in accordance with the International 
Residential Code (IRC) if they contain no more than 
five guest rooms. 

Group R‐4 occupancy 
classification 

310.6 
The allowance for constructing Group R‐4 supervised 
residential facilities under the IRC has been eliminated. 

 

  310.6 
The uses permitted in a Group R‐4 custodial care facility 
have been expanded to include care recipients who may 
need a limited degree of verbal or physical assistance 
while responding to a fire or other emergency situation. 

Classification of accessory 
storage spaces 

  311.1.1 
Storage rooms less than 100 square feet in floor area 
are not to be classified as Group S, but rather as the 
same occupancy as the portion of the building to which 
they are accessory. 

Open mall buildings  402 
A variety of changes have now been made to clarify 
the open mall building provisions that were 
originally developed for covered mall conditions. 

 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 3 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 2 Building Planning (Chapters 3 through 6), continued
Private garages – Definition, 
floor‐area limitation 

  202 
Motor vehicles stored in a “private garage” are now 
limited through a new definition to only those 
vehicles used by tenants of the building or buildings 
on the same premises as the garage. 

  406.3.1 
A group U private garage is now limited to a 
maximum floor area of 1000sf, however, multiple 
Group U private garages are permitted in the same 
building where they are compartmentalized by 
minimum 1‐hour fire separations. 

 

 
 

Topic  2012  2015 

Public parking garage  406.4 
Those parking structures that fall outside of the 
scope of Section 406.3 regulating private parking 
garages are now identified as public parking garages.

 

Group I‐2 shared living 
spaces 

  407.2.5 
Shared living spaces, group meeting area, and 
multipurpose therapeutic spaces are now permitted 
to be open to corridors in Group I‐2, Condition 1 
nursing homes provided fire specific conditions are 
met. 

Group I‐2 cooking facilities    407.2.6 
A room or space containing a cooking facility with 
domestic cooking appliances is now permitted to be 
open to the corridor in a Group I‐2, Condition 1 
nursing home provided 13 specific conditions are 
met. 

Maximum size of Group I‐2 
smoke compartments 

  407.5 
The maximum allowable smoke compartment size 
for Group I‐2, Condition 2 hospitals and similar 
occupancies has been increased to 40,000 square 
feet. 

Technical production areas  410.6.3, 202 
Outdated terminology, such as fly galleries, 
gridirons, and pin rails, has been replaced by the 
general and comprehensive term “technical 
production area” and the special means of egress 
provisions for such areas have all been relocated to 
Section 410. 

 

  

Example: If non-sprinklered building of Type VB construction,
 total allowable area limited to 5500 sq. ft.
 plus any applicable frontage increase

Each Group U private
garage limited to 1000 sq. ft.

Minimum 1-hour
fire barriers (typical)

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

 

 
 

Topic 

Part 2 Bu
Travel distance
manufacturing

Topic 

Ambulatory ca

2

uilding Plan
e in aircraft 
g facilities 

 

2

re facilities  4
In
th
ca
th
th
le
p
 

Sm
22,

M
wh

2012 

nning (Cha

012 

22 
n a multi‐tenant 
here are uses pr
are facility, a fire
he care facility a
he ambulatory c
east four care re
reservation at a

 

Ambulato

moke compartm
500 sf max.

inimum of two 
here ACF exce

201

apters 3 th

or mixed‐occup
esent other tha
e‐partition is now
nd those nonrel
care facility is int
cipients incapab
ny one time. 

ory care facility 

ment 1 Smoke 
22,500 

smoke compa
eeds 10,000 sf

5 Internation

 

Page 4 

hrough 6), 

 

 

pancy building w
n an ambulatory
w required betw
lated spaces wh
tended to have a
ble of self‐

(ACF)

compartment 
sf max.

Smoke barrier

rtments

nal Building C

2015 

continued
412.7 
The trave
manufact
increased
manufact

2015 

where 
y 
ween 
ere 
at 

 

2

Separate ten

Fire pa
require
has � 4
recipien
of self p

Code –Transit

d

el distance allow
turing facilities h
d based upon a c
turing area’s hei

 

nant space

rtition
d where ACF
4 care
nts incapable
preservation

tion from the

wances for aircra
have been signif
combination of t
ight and floor ar

 

e 2009 IBC 

ft 
ficantly 
the 
rea. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



T

S
c
o
G

G
a
h
s

2015 Interna

Topic 

Part 2 Bui
Storm shelters s
critical emergen
operations facili
Group E occupa

General building
area limitations;
height and num
stories, Building

ational Buildi

20

ilding Plan
serving 
ncy 
ties and 
ncies 

 

 

g height and 
; Building 
ber of 
g area 

 

 

ing Code –Tra

12 

nning (Chap

ansition from

pters 3 thr

m the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 5 

rough 6), c

 

C 

2015 

continued
423.3 
The constr
required in
where suc
areas whe
tornadoes 

423.4 
Storm she
occupancie
the shelter
highest. 

503 
The provis
limitations
change in t
an increase
technical c

Tables 504
In order to
of the proc
height pro
now been 
height in fe
stories abo
sprinkler in
into the ne

ruction of compl
n critical emerge
h facilities are lo
re the shelter de
 is at its highest

lters are now re
es located in tho
r design wind sp

sions regulating 
s have been exte
technical applica
ed degree of use
consistency. 

4.3 & 504.4 
o increase the de
cess by which th
ovisions are dete
reformatted as 
eet) and 504.4 (
ove grade plane
ncrease has bee
ew tables. 

lying storm shelt
ency operations 
ocated in geogra
esign wind spee
. 

quired in Group
ose areas of the 
peed for tornado

building height a
ensively revised 
ation in order to
er‐friendliness a

egree of user‐fri
he allowable bui
ermined, Table 5
Tables 504.3 (A
Allowable numb
), and any applic
en incorporated 

ters is now 
facilities 
aphical 
d for 

p E 
U.S. where 
oes is at its 

and area 
with no 
o provide 
and 

endliness 
lding 
503 has 
llowable 
ber of 
cable 
directly 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

Topic 

Part 2 Bu
General buildin
and area limita
Building height
number of stor
area, Continute

Topic 

Mezzanine – M
egress and Ope

Unlimited area
Accessory occu
Basements in u
area buildings 

Unlimited area
Group H occup
Group H‐5 in u
area buildings 

2

uilding Plan
ng height 
ations; 
t and 
ries, Building 
ed 

2

Means of 
enness 

5
T
e
g

 

a buildings – 
upancies; 
unlimited 

5
T
sc
o
a
n

 

a buildings – 
pancies; 
nlimited 

5
T
p
c
a

 

012 

nning (Cha

012 

05.2.2 
he specific prov
gress have been
eneral reference

07.1.1 (507.1) 
he allowance fo
coped under the
f Section 507 to
ccessory occupa
ow contained w

07.8 
he limitations p
ermitted in unli
larified and refo
pplication. 

201

apters 3 th
 

isions for mezza
n deleted and re
e to Chapter 10.

r occupancy gro
e unlimited area
 be located in su
ancies provisions
within the code t

laced on Group 
mited area build
ormatted to aid i

5 Internation

 

Page 6 

hrough 6), 

 

 
 

anine means of 
placed with a 
 

oups not specific
 building provisi
uch buildings un
s of Section 508
ext. 

H occupancies 
ding have been 
n their consisten

nal Building C

2015 

continued
Table 506
In order t
of the pro
provision
reformatt
factor in s
increase 
new table

2015 

 

505.2.3 
Direct acc
level is no
mezzanin
505.2.3.

cally 
ions 
der 
.2 is 

 

507.1 
The allow
unlimited

nt 

 

507.9 
Group H‐
unlimited
Section 5

Code –Transit

d
6.2 
to increase the d
ocess by which t
ns are determine
ted as new Tabl
square feet), an
has been incorp
e. 

cess to at least o
o longer require
nes regulated by

wance of a single
d area buildings 

‐5 buildings are n
d in area under t
507. 

tion from the

degree of user‐f
the allowable bu
ed, Table 503 ha
e 506.2 (allowab
d any applicable
porated directly 

one exit at the m
ed for those encl
y Exception 2 of S

e‐story basemen
have now been 

now permitted t
the special provi

e 2009 IBC 

riendliness 
uilding area 
s been 
ble area 
e sprinkler 
into the 

mezzanine 
osed 
Section 

nt in 
clarified. 

to be 
isions of 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 Interna

Topic 

Part 2 Bu
Incidental uses
provisions; Sep
Protection; Roo
areas; Fire prot
incidental uses

Topic 

Horizontal buil
separation 

ational Buildi

2

uilding Plan
s – General 
paration and 
oms or 
tection from 
s 

5
T
h
re

5
A
e
m
in

T
T
li
fa
re
re
a

 

2

ding   

ing Code –Tra

012 

nning (Cha
09.1 
he concept of in
as been clarified
elationship with

09.4 
An automatic spr
xtinguishing sys
means of providi
ncidental use roo

able 509 
he list of inciden
nen collection ro
acilities and such
emainder of the
esistance‐rated f
ssemblies.   

012 

ansition from

apters 3 th

ncidental uses 
d by eliminating 
 the mixed‐occu

rinkler system is 
tem specifically 
ng any fire prote
oms and area. 

ntal uses now in
ooms in Group B
h rooms must be
 building by min
fire barriers and

m the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 7 

hrough 6), 

the previous 
upancy provision

now the only fir
permitted as a 
ection required f

cludes waste an
B ambulatory ca
e separated from
nimum 1‐hour fir
d/or horizontal 

 

 
 

C 

2015 

continued

ns. 

 

re‐

for 

 

nd 
re 
m the 
re‐

 

Table 509
A more d
within a h
now poss
regulatin

2015 

510.2 
In the spe
pedestal 
story abo
structure
separatio

d

9 
detailed analysis 
healthcare or am
sible due to mod
g incidental use

ecial provisions 
buildings, there
ove grade plane 
e that occurs bel
on. 

of various supp
mbulatory care f
difications to Tab
s 

 

of Section 510.2
 is no longer a li
for that portion 
ow the 3‐hour h

ort spaces 
facility is 
ble 509 

2 addressing 
mit of one 
 of the 
horizontal 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

 

 

 

Topic 

Part 3 Fire
Topic 

Identification o
smoke separat

Projections at e
walls 

Topic 

Combustible p

Buildings on th

2

e Protectio
2

of fire and 
ion walls 

7
T
o
b
m

exterior   

2

rojections   

he same lot   

012 

on (Chapte
012 

03.7 
he size & locatio
n vertical fire as
een modified to

markings to be se

012 

 

201

ers 7 ‐ 9) 

on of identifying
ssembly’s above
o increase the po
een. 

5 Internation

 

Page 8 

g markings requi
‐ceiling spaces h
otential for such

nal Building C

2015 

2015 

red 
have 
 

 

705.2 
The minim
leading e
determin
modified 
increase 
modified

2015 

705.2.3 
The provi
adjacent 
determin
modified 
approach
determin

705.3 
Opening 
walls of a
building o
regulated
fire separ

Code –Transit

mum required s
dge of a project
ne the fire separa
in a manner tha
in the separatio
. 

isions regulating
to an interior lo
ne the fire separa
to provide a sim

h that is less rest
ned. 

are permitted th
a Group S‐2 park
on the same lot 
d as two building
ration distance i

tion from the

eparation betwe
tion and the line
ation distance h
at provides for a
n required.  Tab

 

g combustible pr
ot line or other li
ation distance h
mple and consist
trictive than prev

hrough adjacent
king garage and 
where such buil
gs on the same l
s zero. 

e 2009 IBC 

een the 
e used to 
as been 
a significant 
ble 705.2 is 

rojections 
ne used to 
ave been 
tent 
viously 

t exterior 
a Group R‐2 
ldings are 
ot and the 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 9 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 ‐ 9), Continued 

Structural element bracing 
of exterior walls 

  705.6 
Interior structural elements, such as floor or roof 
elements, that brace exterior walls are no longer 
required to be regulated for fire resistance due to 
the exterior wall’s ratings regardless of the 
building’s proximity to a lot line. 

Structural stability of fire 

walls 

706.2 
To satisfy the intended objective of structural 
stability the use of a double fire wall complying with 
NFPA 221 is permitted as an alternative to a single 
fire wall. 

706.2 
The reference to NFPA 221 for fire wall design and 
construction has been expanded to permit the use 
of the “tied” and “cantilevered” options addressed 
in the standard. 

 
 

 
 

Topic  2012  2015 

Intersections of fire 
barriers at roof assemblies 

707.8, 707.9 
The void at the intersection between a fire barrier 
and a nonfire‐resistance rated roof assembly now 
need only to be protected with an approved material 
rather than a fire‐resistant joint system. 

 

Horizontal assemblies and 
vertical openings 

712 
Significant reformatting in Chapter 7 now places 
emphasis on the presence of vertical openings rather 
than on shaft enclosures, recognizing the use of shaft 
enclosures is just one of many acceptable protective 
measures that can be utilized to address the hazards 
related to vertical openings. 

711, 712 
The reorganization of Section 711 and 712 has been 
continued such that Section 711 now contains only 
the construction requirements for floor and roof 
assemblies, and Section 712 only contains the 
requirements related to the protection of vertical 
openings. 

Floor penetration of 

horizontal assembly 

714.4.1.2 (714.4.1.1.2) Exception 2 
An approved through‐penetration fire‐stop system 
used to protect floor penetrations of horizontal 
assemblies due to the presence of floor, tub, & 
shower drains is no longer required to have a T 
rating. 

 

  

Minimum clear space
per NFPA 221, Table A5.7

Double fire wall

No connections between
fire walls other than
flashing

Minimum fire wall rating 
(in hours)

Total double
wall rating

Rating of
individual walls

3

2

1

4

3

2

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

Topic 

Part 3 Fir
Membrane pen

L ratings 

Marking of fire

glazing assemb

Opening prote

and markings, 

protection‐rate

2

e Protectio
netration    

7
A
d
p
sy
co

e‐rated 

blies, 

ction ratings 

Fire‐

ed glazing 

7
T
v
d
m

T
T
(7
fi
a
in
fo
ra
si

012 

on (Chapte

14.4.4 (714.5), 7
An “L” rating iden
efined in Chapte
enetration firest
ystems that are 
onstruction. 

16.3, 202 
able 716.3 has b
arious test stand
efined in Chapte

mark such glazing

able 716.5 
he information 
715.4 in 2009) a
re‐protection ra
ssemblies has b
nclude the maxim
or door vision pa
ating and glazing
idelights and tra

201

ers 7 ‐ 9), C

715.6, 202 
ntifying the air le
er 2 – is now ma
top systems and
utilized in smok

been added to d
dards for fire‐rat
er 2 to the desig
g. 

previously availa
ddressing the m
atings of fire doo
een extensively 
mum size and m
anels and the m
g marking requir
ansoms.  

5 Internation

 

Page 10 

Continued

eakage rate ‐ as 
andated for 
d fire‐resistant jo
ke barrier 

efine and relate
ted glazing, now
gnations used to

able in Table 716
minimum require
or and fire shutte
expanded to als

marking requirem
inimum assemb
rements for 

nal Building C

2015 

714.4.2
The ceiling
roof/ceilin
double wo
the ceiling
be sheath
wall will n
needed d
penetratin

oint 

 

e the 
w 
o 

 

6.5 
ed 
er 
so 
ments 
ly 

 

Code –Transit

g of a 1‐hour or 2
ng assembly is pe
ood top plate of a
g membrane of th
hed only with Typ
not require a fire‐
ue to some other
ng the top plates 

tion from the

2‐hour floor/ceilin
ermitted to be int
a wall.  The wall in
he horizontal asse
pe X gypsum wallb
resistance rating 
r code requireme
must be protecte

 

e 2009 IBC 

ng or 
errupted by 
nterrupting 
embly must 
board.  The 
unless 
ent.  Items 
ed. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



T

P
 

W

a

 

2015 Interna

Topic 

Part 3 Fire

Wired glass in fi

assemblies 

ational Buildi

20

e Protectio
Ta
In 
rat
req
spe

re window  71
Th
co
be

ing Code –Tra

12 

on (Chapter
ble 716.6 
addition to fire w
tings, Table 716.
quired on the fir
ecified applicatio

6.6.4 (715.5.4 a
e allowance for 
mpliance with th
en deleted.  

 

ansition from

rs 7 ‐ 9), Co

window assemb
.6 now identifies
re‐rated glazing 
ons. 

nd 715.5.5 in 20
the use of wired
he appropriate t

m the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 11 

 

ontinued 

bly fire protectio
s the markings 
for acceptance i

009) 
d glass without 
test standards h

C 

2015 

on 

in 

 

as 

 

 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 12 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 ‐ 9), Continued 

Corridor dampers    717.3, 717.5 
Where a duct penetration occurs in the ceiling of a 
fire‐resistance‐rated corridor where the lid of the 
corridor is constructed using a corridor wall placed 
horizontally, a corridor damper is now specifically 
mandated. 

Sprinkler systems – 

Assembly occupancies on 

roofs 

  903.2.1.6 
An automatic sprinkler system is now required to be 
installed in a building when the roof is used for a 
Group A‐2 assembly occupancy with an occupant 
load exceeding 100, as well as other Group A 
occupancies where the occupant load exceeds 300. 

Multiple fire areas    903.2.1.7 
Where small Group A fire areas share a common 
means of egress, the occupant load of the spaces 
must now be added together to determine if a 
sprinkler system is required. 

Sprinklers systems – Group 

R occupancies 

  903.2.8 
Sprinkler requirements for Group R‐4 occupancies 
are now dependent on the capabilities of the 
occupants.  In buildings where occupants required 
limited assistance when responding to an 
emergency condition, additional sprinkler protection 
is required for attic space. 

Furniture storage and 

display in Group F‐1, M and 

S‐1 occupancies 

903.2.4, 903.2.7, 903.2.9 
Automatic sprinkler systems are now required in 
occupancies where upholstered furniture or 
mattresses are manufactured, stored, or displayed. 

 

Sprinkler protection for 

basements 

903.2.11.1.3 
Basements provided with walls, partitions, or fixtures 
that can obstruct water from hose streams now 
require automatic sprinkler protection. 

 

Open‐ended corridors    903.3.1.2.2 
Where an NFPA 13R sprinkler system is installed, the 
sprinkler protection must now be extended to any 
open‐ended corridors and associated exterior 
stairways, clarifying that an open breezeway is 
considered as an interior portion of the building and 
not an exterior location for the application of 
sprinkler requirements. 

Actuation of multiple fire‐

extinguishing systems 

904.3.2 
When two or more alternative automatic 
fire‐ extinguishing systems are required to protect a 
hazard, all of the systems must now be designed to 
simultaneously operate. 

 

Portable fire extinguishers 

in Group R‐2 occupancies 

906.1 
Portable fire extinguishers are no longer required in 
many public and common areas of Group R‐2 
occupancies provided a complying extinguisher is 
provided within each individual dwelling unit. 

 

Fire alarm systems in 

Group A occupancies 

907.2.1 
Requirements for a fire alarm system in a building 
housing two or more Group A occupancies are now 
based on whether or not the occupancies are in 
separate fire areas. 

 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 13 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 3 Fire Protection (Chapters 7 ‐ 9), Continued 

Emergency voice/alarm 

communication captions 

907.2.1.2 
Mass notification fire alarm signals in large stadiums, 
arenas, and grandstands now require captioned 
messages. 

 

Group E fire alarms    907.2.3 
The threshold for alarm systems in Group E 
occupancies has been increased such that a manual 
fire alarm is required where the occupant load 
exceeds 50, and an emergency voice/alarm 
communication (EVAC) system must only be 
provided for the occupant load exceeds 100. (2012 
had dropped thresholds to 30) 

Smoke detection and alarm 

systems in Group R‐2 

college buildings 

907.2.9.3 
A smoke detection system, tied into the occupant 
notification system, is now required in certain public 
and common spaces of Group R‐2 college and 
university buildings, and the required smoke alarms 
within individual dwelling and sleeping units must be 
interconnected with the building’s fire alarm and 
detection system. 

907.2.3 
The scope of the fire alarm provisions for Group R‐2 
college and university buildings has been revised to 
apply to facilities “operated by” the college or 
university whether owned by the school or not. 

Smoke alarms near cooking 

appliances and bathrooms 

  907.2.11.3, 903.2.11.4 
Requirements from the NFPA 72 standard 
addressing the installation of smoke alarms near 
cooking appliances and bathrooms have been 
introduced to the IBC in order to provide direct 
guidance on the placement of smoke alarms. 

Wireless interconnection of 

smoke alarms 

907.2.11.5 (907.2.11.3) 
The smoke alarm interconnection 
requirements are now applicable to Group I‐1 
occupancies and include allowances for use of 
wireless alarms. 

 

Smoke and heat removal    910 
The format and technical requirements for smoke 
and heat removal systems have been revised, 
including a new allowance permitting a mechanical 
smoke removal system as an alternative to smoke 
and heat vents. 

Carbon monoxide alarms  915 (908.7) 
In new and existing buildings, carbon monoxide (CO) 
alarms are now required in Group R and I 
occupancies with fuel‐burning appliances or attached 
garages. 

915 
The carbon monoxide (CO) alarm provisions have 
been relocated, reformatted and revised; the scope 
has been modified to exclude Group I‐3 occupancies 
while adding Group E occupancies. 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

T

P
C

T

A

 

Topic 

Part 4 Mea
Cumulative occu

Topic 

Design occupant
Areas without fi

20

ans of Egr
upant load   

20

t load – 
xed seating 

10
An
ga
oc

012 

ess (Chapt

012 

004.1.2, Table 10
n occupant load 
alleries has been
ccupant. 

 

Office
10 occupant

Office
10 occupant

Lobb
10 occupant

201

ter 10) 

004.1.2 
factor for muse

n established at 3

e
s

#

#3

#4

e
s

y
s

A

B

D

•
•

5 Internation

 

Page 14 

 

 

ums and exhibit
30 square feet p

 

 

Open offic
150 occu

1

C

•  Door #4 sized to ac
•  Lobby D only requir

nal Building C

2015 

1004.1.1
The determ
occupant l
levels and 

2015 

t 
per 

 

ce area
upants

ccommodate 100 occu
res a single exit

Code –Transit

mination of the 
load for interven
adjacent stories

 

#2

upants

tion from the

cumulative desi
ning spaces, adja
s has been clarif

 

e 2009 IBC 

gn 
acent 
fied. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

T

O

T

P

d

o
d

S
a

2015 Interna

Topic 

Occupant load f

Topic 

Part 4 Mea
Means of egress
determination 

Means of egress
of exits and exit 
doorways 

Exits from dwell

Spaces with one
access doorway 

ational Buildi

20

actors   

20

ans of Egr
s capacity  10

Re
fo
vo
ex
in 

s, Numbers 
access 

 

ing units  Ta
A 
pe
Ch
pr

e exit or exit   

ing Code –Tra

012 

012 

ess (Chapt
005 
educed exit widt
r sprinklered bu
oice/alarm comm
xit width/capacit
a more logical a

able 1006.3.2 (10
new section clar
ermitted within o
hanges to Sec. 10
rovide a second 

ansition from

ter 10). Co

th factors have b
uilding provided 
munication (EVA
ty requirements
and organized la

021.2(1)) 
rifies when a sin
or from an indiv
021.2 and the ta
option for comp

m the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 15 

ntinued 

been established
with an emerge

AC) system, and t
 are now presen
yout. 

ngle exit is 
vidual dwelling u
ables will also 
pliance. 

C 

2015 

Table 1004
The merca
revised suc
regardless
is located.

2015 

d 
ency 
the 
nted 

 

1006, 1007
Provisions 
number of
for rooms 
reformatte
The means
spaces, alo
consolidat
address th
and Sectio
configurat

unit. 

Note: Tabl
code are n
2015 code

Table 1006
A new tab
requireme
with the p
travel from
 

See next p

4.1.2 
antile occupant l
ch that a single f
s of the story on 

7 
addressing the 
f means of egres
and space as we
ed and relocated
s of egress requ
ong with those f
ted in Chapter 10
he number of me
on 1007 will addr
tion (arrangeme

les 1021.2(1) an
now Tables 1006
e due to reforma

6.2.1 
le combines the
ents from 2012 I
rovisions for com
m Section 1014.3

page for Table

oad factor has b
factor is now ap
which the merc

 

minimum requi
ss and their arra
ell as stories hav
d. 
irements for roo
for stories, have 
0.  Section 1006
eans of egress re
ress the egress 
nt/separation).

d 1021.2(2) in th
6.3.2(1) and 1006
atting of Chapter

e occupant load 
BC Table 1015.1
mmon path of e
3 into a single lo

 1006.2.1.

been 
pplicable 
cantile use 

red 
ngement 
ve been 

oms and 
been 
 will 
equired 

he 2012 
6.3.2(2) in 
r 10 

1 along 
egress 
ocation. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 
2015 Internation

 

Page 16 

nal Building CCode –Transittion from the

 

e 2009 IBC 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 17 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued 

Exit and exit access 
doorway configuration 

  1007.1 
Specific information is now provided regarding the 
point where exit separation is to be measured.  In 
addition, where three or more means of egress are 
required, performance language has been included 
to ensure the egress paths are adequately 
separated. 

 

 
 

 
 

Topic  2012  2015 

Door operations – Locking 
systems 

  1010.1.9 
Numerous revisions throughout the locking 
provisions now help clarify requirements and their 
application through the use of consistent 
terminology. 

Application of stairway 
provisions 

1011.1 (1009.1) 
Stairway provisions have been clarified to apply to 
any stairway serving occupied portions of a building, 
including “convenience” stairways that are not a 
portion of a required means of egress or required 
means of egress stairways. 

 

  

Separation measured at any point
along the width of the doorway

Separation as required by
Section 1007.1.1 for two of
the doorways.
  • One-half of overall diagonal, or
  • One-third of diagonal if sprinklered

Additional route
“a reasonable

distance apart”
to prevent both
being blocked

Space requiring three
or more means of egress

Required separation
distance measured to

closest riser

Required separation shall be
maintained for all portions of:
 •  Exit access stairway
 •  Exit access ramp

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 18 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued 

Floor level exit signs in 
Group R‐1 

1013.2 (1011.2) 
Where general‐use exit signs are required in R‐1 
occupancies, low‐level exit signs must also be 
provided in the means of egress serving the guest 
rooms. 

 

Guards at operable 
windows 

1015.1 (1013.1, 1013.8) 
The guard requirements for operable windows 
having a sill height more than 72 inches above the 
finished grade have been relocated from Chapter 14 
to the general guard provisions of Chapter 10 and 
the minimum window sill height at which a guard is 
not required has been increased from 24 inches to 
36 inches. 

 

Egress through intervening 
spaces 

  1016.2 
A means of egress is now permitted through an 
elevator lobby provided access to at least one exit is 
available without passing through the lobby. 

Travel distance increase for 
Groups F‐1 and S‐1 

  1017.2.2 
An increased exit access travel distance is now 
permitted for Groups F‐1 and S‐1 occupancies where 
specific requirements are met 

Aisles in Groups B and M    1018.3 
The required width of aisles in Groups B and M 
occupancies is now consistent with the widths 
required for corridors and is no longer limited only 
to the capacity based on the occupant load served. 

Exit access stairways and 
ramps 

1019 (1009, 1010) 
Revisions have been made throughout the code to 
coordinate the provisions for unenclosed interior 
stairways and ramps (exit access stairways and 
ramps) that can be used as a portion of the means of 
egress.  Relies on the distinction of “exit access” 
stair versus “exit” stair. 

 

 

 
 
  

Office suite 4
OL = 300

Office suite 2
OL = 80

Office suite 3
OL = 80

Office suite 1
OL = 80

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 19 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 4 Means of Egress (Chapter 10). Continued 

Enclosure penetrations of 
interior exit stairways 

1023.5 (1022.5) 
Penetrations of the outside membrane of a fire 
barrier utilized to enclose an interior exit stair or 
ramp are now permitted provided the penetration is 
properly protected. 

 

Separation of spaces under 
grandstands and bleachers 

1029.1.1.1 (1028.1.1.1) 
Spaces beneath grandstands and bleachers are now 
required to be adequately separated to protect the 
assembly seating area form any potential hazards. 

 

Stepped aisle construction 
tolerances 

  1029.13.2.2.1 
The variation allowed between adjacent risers 
within a stepped aisle is now limited. 

Part 5 Accessibility (Chapter 11) 
Areas in places of religious 
worship 

  1103.2.8 
Small areas used for religious ceremonies are now 
exempt from the access requirements. 

Employee work areas  1104.3.1 
Where an employee work area is less than 1,000 
square feet in floor area, the common use 
circulation path need not meet the accessible route 
requirements. 

 

Multistory buildings and 
facilities, Accessible spaces 
and routes 

  1104.4 
A distinction has been made between the 
requirements for access within a story and those 
with greater level changes, such as between stories 
or mezzanines. 

  1107.3, 1107.4 
The provisions for connecting all spaces within a 
building have been modified to clearly identify the 
distinction for those with a change of elevation 
between stories or mezzanines. 

Group R – Accessible units    1107.6.1.1 
The method by which multiple buildings on a site 
are reviewed when determining the required 
number of Accessible units has been revised to 
consider building size in addition to the total 
number of units on the site. 

  

Waiting
commons

Rest
rooms

Office

Sleeping rooms

Sleeping rooms

Dining Activities
Therapy/

counseling
Kitchen

Meeting
rooms

Accessible Units in Group I-1 and R-4 Occupancies

R-4 OccupanciesI-1 Occupancies

Condition 1

≥4% but not less than 1 ≥10% but not less than 1 At least 1 At least 2 units*

* Bedrooms within Group R-4 facilities shall be counted as sleeping units for the purpose of determining the
  number of units.

Condition 2 Condition 1 Condition 2

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 20 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 5 Accessibility (Chapter 11) 
Captioning of public 
address announcements 

1108.2.7.3 
The captioning of audible public announcements is 
now only required for assembly spaces having a 
public address system and 15,000 or more seats. 

 

Accessible children’s 
facilities 

1109.2, 1109.5 
Toilet facilities and drinking fountains “primarily for 
children’s use” may now be installed at a lower 
height than generally permitted for accessible 
elements and considered as the required accessible 
elements. 

 

Recreational facilities    1110 
More detailed scoping requirements for recreational 
facilities have been included within the new Section 
1110 to coordinate with the ADA and provide the 
scoping for technical requirements found within 
Chapter 11 of the A 117.1 standard. 

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  
(Chapters 12 through 26) 
Toilet and bathroom 

requirements 

1210 
The water closet compartment and urinal partition 
requirements have been from Chapter 29 to Section 
1210. 

 

Vapor retarders    1405.3 
The required types and locations appropriate for 
each class of vapor retarder have been revised to 
also indicate where certain vapor retarders are not 
allowed to be installed. 

Roof gardens and 
landscaped roofs, Roof 
loads 

1507.16 
The IBC now provides a reference to a new IFC 
provisions on roof gardens and landscaped roofs as a 
means of controlling the potential hazards these 
combustible materials on the roof could create. 

 

Photovoltaic systems  1507.17, 3111, 202 
Photovoltaic elements (modules/shingles or 
systems) must now meet the general code 
requirements for roofing materials and roof top 
structures. 

 

Rooftop structures  1510 (1509), 202 
In addition to several technical changes, the 
provisions addressing rooftop structures have been 
reformatted to better organize and clarify the 
requirements. 

 

Construction documents, 
Special loads 

  1603 
Two additional items related to snow load drifting 
are now required to be identified on the 
construction documents. 

  1603.1.8 
The dead load of any rooftop‐mounted photovoltaic 
(PV) solar panels must now be identified on the 
construction documents. 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



T

P
(

 

2015 Interna

Topic 

Part 6 Buil
(Chapters 
Risk category 

Minimum Live lo

ational Buildi

20

lding Enve
12 throug

16
Th
to 
me
us

 

oads  16
Th
Ta
or
an

ing Code –Tra

012 

elope, Stru
gh 26), Con
604.5 
he term “Occupa
“risk category” 
eaning and to co
ed in ASCE 7‐10

607.1 
he live loads esta
ble 1607.1 have
der to coordinat
nd Table 4‐1 in A

 

ansition from

ctural Syst
ntinued 

ancy category” h
to better reflect
oordinate with t
. 

ablished in IBC S
e been modified 
te with the live l
ASCE 7‐10. 

m the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 21 

tems, and 

has been change
t the intended 
he terminology 

ection 1607 and
and updated in 
oads of Chapter

 

C 

2015 

Construct

ed 
 

1604.5 
In the app
category fo
revised to 
ASCE 7 Tab
instead.  In
III structur
occupancy

d 

r 4 

 

tion Mater

lication of assign
or a structure, S
clarify that whe
ble 1.5‐1, IBC Ta
n addition, descr
res have been re
y classifications t

rials  

ning the approp
Section 1604.5 h
ere standards ref
ble 1604.5 shou
riptions for Risk 
evised to include
to help clarify th

 

riate risk 
as been 
ferred to 
uld be used 
Category 
e 
he intent. 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

 

2015 Internation

 

Page 22 

nal Building CCode –Transittion from the

 

e 2009 IBC 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



 

2015 Internaational Buildiing Code –Tra

 

ansition fromm the 2009 IBC
 

 

Page 23 

 

C 

 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 24 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued 

Photovoltaic panel systems, 
Ballasted photovoltaic 
panel systems 

  1607.12.5 
Design requirements for roof structures supporting 
photovoltaic (PV) solar panels and modules have 
been added to Section 1607. 

  1613.6 
Seismic requirements for ballasted roof‐mounted 
photovoltaic (PV) solar panels have been added to 
section 1613.6. 

Determination of wind 
loads 

1609, 202 
The wind design requirements of Section 1609 have 
been updated and coordinated with the latest wind 
load provisions in ASCE/SEI 7 (ASCE 7‐10) and the 
wind load maps in the IBC are now based on 
ultimate design wind speeds, Vult, which produce a 
strength level wind load similar to seismic load 
effects. 

 

Mapped acceleration 
parameters 

1613.3.1, 202 
The IBC seismic ground motion maps have been 
updated to reflect the 2008 maps developed by the 
United States Geological Survey (USGS) National 
Seismic Hazard Mapping Project and the technical 
changes adopted for the 2009 NEHRP Recommended 
Seismic Provisions for New Buildings and Other 
Structures (FEMA P750). 

1613.3.1 
The U.S. Geological Survey (USGS) recently 
developed seismic hazard and Risk‐Targeted 
Maximum Considered Earthquake (MCER) ground 
motion maps for Guam and American Samoa, which 
have now been included in the IBC. 

Statement of special 
inspections 

1704.3 
The provisions requiring specific items to have 
special inspection and what information is required 
to be included in the statement of special 
inspections have been clarified and coordinated, 
with previous conflicts between the two being 
resolved. 

 

Submittals to the building 
official 

  1704.5 
Requirements for submittal of reports and 
certificates related to construction that is subject to 
special inspections and tests are now clearly 
specified. 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 25 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued 

Special inspections  1705 
Special inspection requirements for structural steel 
have been deleted from Chapter 17 because the new 
standard for structural steel buildings (ANSI/AISC 
360‐10) includes quality assurance provisions. 
 
Requirements pertaining to special inspection of 
masonry construction were deleted from Chapter 17 
because the 2011 edition of TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 
5 and TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 includes 
requirements for quality assurance of masonry 
construction. 

1705 
Steel construction provisions modified to use new 
terminology that coordinates with Chapter 22 and 
AISC 360 standard.  A new SDI standard addresses 
inspection of cold‐formed steel floor and roof decks 
(SDI QA/QC) (Section 1705.2) 
Special inspections required during installation of 
open web steel joists and joist girders. (Section 
1705.2.3) 
Special inspection of cast‐in‐place anchors in 
concrete where allowable loads have been 
increased or strength design is used have been 
deleted from Table 1705.3 since specific 
requirements for design and installation of adhesive 
anchors is now included in ACI 318.  Continuous 
special inspection is added for these anchors 
installed horizontally or in upwardly inclined 
orientations with sustained loads. (Table 1705.3) 
Periodic special inspection of cold‐formed steel 
special bolted moment frames (CFS‐SBMFs) is now 
mandated.  Modifications to the special inspection 
requirements for seismic resistance have been made 
to clarify the intent.  (Section 1705.12) 

1705.17 (1705.16) 
Where penetration firestop systems and fire‐
resistant joint systems are used in high‐rise buildings 
and those building assigned to Risk Category III and 
IV, it is now mandatory that they be inspected by an 
approved inspection agency as a part of the special 
inspection process. 

 

Structural items moved 
from code to standards 

Chapter 19  
Numerous provisions related to concrete 
construction were deleted from Chapter 19 because 
they are contained in the 2011 edition of ACI 318. 
Building Code Requirements for Structural Concrete 
and Commentary.  (e.g. IBC Sections 1905, 1906, and 
1907 were deleted because they only provided 
referencing to the corresponding sections in the ACI 
318 standard.) 
 
 

1901.3 Anchoring to concrete 
Sections 1908 and 1909 of the 2012 IBC, which 
contain the requirements for anchorage to concrete, 
have been deleted because they are obsolete and 
not consistent with current referenced standards.  
In their place, ne provisions on anchoring to 
concrete have been added to the general provisions 
found in Section 1901. 
 
1904 Durability requirements 
The durability requirements for structural concrete 
have been deleted from the IBC and replaced by a 
reference to the durability provisions in ACI 318. 
2101.2 Masonry Design Methods 
 
The references in Chapter 21 to specific sections in 
the Masonry Standards Joint Committee (MSJC) 
code have been deleted because the 2013 edition of 
TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 has been substantially 
reorganized to be more user‐friendly.  The charging 
language of Section 2101.2 has been modified to 
simply reference TMS 402/ACI 530/ASCE 5 or TMS 
403 for the design and construction of masonry 
structures. 
 
 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 26 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued 

Structural items moved 
from code to standards, 
Continued 

  2103 Masonry Construction Materials 
Masonry material provisions that have historically 
been found in Section 2103 have been deleted 
because they are contained in the MSJC 
Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6. 
 
2104 Masonry Construction 
Many masonry construction provisions previously 
found in Section 2104 that are contained in the 
MSJC Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 have 
been deleted and replaced with references to the 
specification. 
 
2105 Quality Assurance 
Provisions for the quality assurance of masonry 
structures and related definitions have been deleted 
from Section 2106 and replaced with a reference to 
the MSJC Specification TMS 602/ACI 530.1/ASCE 6 
and the special inspection and testing requirements 
contained in Chapter 17. 

Conventional light‐frame 
construction 

  2308 
Section 2308, which contains prescriptive 
requirements for conventional wood frame 
construction, has been reformatted and reorganized 
in its entirety.  Significant changes include the 
introduction of new designations for wall bracing 
method similar to those in the IRC as shown in Table 
2308.6.3(1), and reformatted wall bracing 
requirements set forth in Table 2308.6.1. 

Roof and ceiling framing    2308.7 
Ceiling joist and rafter span tables from the IRC have 
been incorporated into the conventional 
construction provisions of the IBC. 

Safety glazing – hazardous 
locations 

2406.1, 2406.4 
The hazardous locations identified in the safety 
glazing provisions have been reorganized and 
clarified in order to provide better consistency 
between the IBC and IRC. 

 

 

 
 

SG
�60 in.

SG

Bathtub, whirlpool tub
or hot tub

SG = Safety glazing required
Measurements are to exposed glazing

Plan view

SG

SG
SG SG

�60 in.

�60 in.

�60 in.

Section view

Floor

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 27 

36 in.

2012 code did not regulate
glazing ≥36 in. in height

(a) Section

60 in.

Glazing <60 in. above landing
and within 60 in. horizonzally
of bottom tread nosing
is in a hazardous location.
 • Requires safety glazing, or
 • Protection by guard per
 exception in Section 2406.4.7

60 in.

Glazing regulated
within a 60 in.
horizontal arc
if less than
180 degress
from bottom
tread nosing

(b) Plan

60 in.

60 in.

180°

Down

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 6 Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  
(Chapters 12 through 26), Continued 

Safety glazing – impact test  2406.2 
The default impact test criteria have been revised to 
impose the more restrictive test methodology.  The 
higher impact requirements will apply unless the 
tables in Section 2406.2 allow for a lower impact test 
to be used. 

 

Safety glazing adjacent to 
bottom stair landing 

  2406.4.7 
The height criteria for regulating glazing at the 
landing at the bottom of a stair has been revised 
and the method for measuring the horizontal 
distance has been clarified, now generally requiring 
safety glazing if located less than 60 inches above 
the bottom landing of the stair. 

 
 

 
 

                
 
 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 
 
Topic  2012  2015 

Water‐resistive barriers for 
stucco applications  

2510.6 
In order to reduce the likelihood of moisture getting 
into the building, detailed requirements have been 
provided for the installation of the two layers of 
weather‐resistive barriers that are required behind 
stucco‐covered exterior walls. 

 

Foam plastic insulation 
installed in floor assemblies 

2603.4.1.14 
The use of 1/2‐inch wood structural panels installed 
on the walking surface side of a floor assembly is 
now permitted as an alternative to the thermal 
barrier typically required where foam plastic 
insulation is installed within a floor assembly. 

 

Special approval of foam 
plastics 

2603.9 (2603.10, 2603.10.1) 
The specific approval requirements now ensure that 
the smoke development of all assemblies that 
contain foam plastic is evaluated regardless of the 
test standard used. 

 

Plastic composites    2612 
New definitions and applicable test standards now 
address the use of plastic composites for use as 
exterior deck boards, stair treads, handrails and 
guards. 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 28 

Topic  2012  2015 

Part 7 Building Services, Special Devices, and Special Conditions  
(Chapters 27 through 34) 
Single‐user toilet facilities  2902.2 

Where separate sex toilet facilities are required and 
only one water closet is required in each facility, two 
family or assisted‐use toilet rooms may now be 
provided as an acceptable alternative. 

 

Toilet facilities in parking 
garages 

2902.3  
Public toilet facilities are no longer required in open 
and enclosed parking garages and employee toilet 
facilities are not required in those garages that do 
not have parking attendants. 

 

Public toilet facilities     2902.3 
Limited‐size quick‐service tenant spaces are no 
longer required to provide toilet facilities for the 
public customers. 

Elevator hoistway venting    3004 
The elevator hoistway venting provisions of Section 
3004 have been deleted; such hoistways are no 
longer required to be vented to the exterior. 

Elevator lobbies and 
hoistway opening 
protection 

  3006 
The elevator lobby requirements have been 
relocated from Section 713.14.1, where they were 
previously included with the general shaft enclosure 
requirements, to Chapter 30, which addresses 
elevators.  Provisions now focus on hoistway 
opening protection, with lobbies being one of three 
options (enclosed lobbies, additional door, or 
hoistway pressurization). 

Fire service access 
elevators, Occupant 
evacuation elevators 

3007 
Many of the provisions addressing fire service access 
elevators have now been coordinated with those 
applicable to occupant evacuation elevators to 
ensure that the fire service access elevators are able 
to continue to function and serve their intended 
purpose during an emergency. 
 
3008 
The provisions addressing occupant evacuation 
elevators are now more closely coordinated with 
those regulating fire service access elevators 

 

Existing structures    Chapter 34 
Chapter 34 has been deleted from the IBC in its entirety, 
and existing buildings will now be solely regulated by the 
International Existing Building Code (IEBC). 

Type B units in existing 
buildings 

IEBC 410 (3411) 
Type B units are now required in existing buildings 
when there is a change of occupancy or an alteration 
and more than 50 percent of the building is affected.
 
Note:  Because the 2015 IBC deleted Chapter 34, this 
provision is no longer found within the IBC.  
However, this requirement is located in the IEBC 
which is adopted by reference in IBC Section 101.4.7.  
In addition, because this requirement is more 
restrictive than the requirements of the federal Fair 
Housing Act, it is important code users are aware of 
this change. 

 

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.

100563655



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 29 

Notes: 
  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.



2015 International Building Code –Transition from the 2009 IBC 
 

 

Page 30 

Notes: 
 

  

Copyright ©  ICC.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.  Accessed by Robert Turk (r2turk@yahoo.com), ( City of Mineral Wells) Order Number #100563655 on Nov 7, 2018 1:08:19 PM pursuant to License
Agreement with ICC.  No further reproduction or distribution authorized.  Single user only, copying and networking prohibited. ANY UNAUTHORIZED REPRODUCTION OR DISTRIBUTION IS A
VIOLATION OF THE FEDERAL COPYRIGHT ACT AND THE LICENSE AGREEMENT, AND SUBJECT TO CIVIL AND CRIMINAL PENALTIES THEREUNDER.


	Blank Page



